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th th The 20 International Conference on Chemical Education (20 ICCE), which had rd th “Chemistry in the
ICT Age” as the theme, was held from 3 to 8 August 2008 at Le Méridien Hotel, Pointe aux Piments, in
Mauritius. With more than 200 participants from 40 countries, the conference featured 140 oral and 50 poster
presentations. th Participants of the 20 ICCE were invited to submit full papers and the latter were subjected
to peer review. The selected accepted papers are collected in this book of proceedings. This book of
proceedings encloses 39 presentations covering topics ranging from fundamental to applied chemistry, such
as Arts and Chemistry Education, Biochemistry and Biotechnology, Chemical Education for Development,
Chemistry at Secondary Level, Chemistry at Tertiary Level, Chemistry Teacher Education, Chemistry and
Society, Chemistry Olympiad, Context Oriented Chemistry, ICT and Chemistry Education, Green
Chemistry, Micro Scale Chemistry, Modern Technologies in Chemistry Education, Network for Chemistry
and Chemical Engineering Education, Public Understanding of Chemistry, Research in Chemistry Education
and Science Education at Elementary Level. We would like to thank those who submitted the full papers and
the reviewers for their timely help in assessing the papers for publication. th We would also like to pay a
special tribute to all the sponsors of the 20 ICCE and, in particular, the Tertiary Education Commission
(http://tec.intnet.mu/) and the Organisation for the Prohibition of Chemical Weapons (http://www.opcw.org/)
for kindly agreeing to fund the publication of these proceedings.
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From reader reviews:

Peggy Hardman:

The book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the great thing like a book Chemistry
Education in the ICT Age? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book
can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or
data that you take for that, you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Chemistry
Education in the ICT Age has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Beth Ritchey:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different
content. As we know that book is very important for all of us. The book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age
seemed to be making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It
doesn't matter what advantages for you. The book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age is not only giving
you a lot more new information but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your
spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book Chemistry Education in the
ICT Age. You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Jackie Caldwell:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed to be
exactly added. This e-book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age was filled about science. Spend your spare
time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has various feel when
they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In
the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Kent Brown:

That publication can make you to feel relax. That book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age was colourful
and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Chemistry Education in the ICT Age has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can
read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can
make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading
that.
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