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A man tumbles through wild surf, half drowned, to collapse on a moonlit beach. When he regains
consciousness, he has no memory of who he is or where he came from. He knows only that the woman who
washed ashore with him has disappeared sometime in the night and that he has awakened in a surreal
landscape of savage beauty–a mysterious watery world encircled by a thin spine of land. Aided by strange
tribesmen, he journeys to the cove of the spine kings, a brutal race that has enslaved the woman and several
of the tribesmen. That is only the beginning of his quest, as he struggles to find her identity in this wondrous
and cruel land–and seeks out the woman whose hold on his imagination is both unfathomable and
unshakable.

Haunting and lyrical, filled with uncommon beauty and terrible peril, A Short, Sharp Shock is an ambitious
and enthralling story by one of science fiction's most respected talents.

"A fabulation of life, love and beauty transplanted into the alien; a dreamy picaresque…A strange and
hallucinatory short fantasy with occasional sharp insights into human natures and loves… A story that will
haunt you, long after you finish reading." - Infinity Plus

"Mysterious and poetic, with vivid descriptions of the lands through which they walk...compelling." - SFF
Chronicle

"Robinson shows off his vivid imagination and descriptive skills." - Science Fiction Times
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From reader reviews:

Linda Doyle:

Why? Because this A Short Sharp Shock is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to
snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic
author who else write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of gains than the other
book possess such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to
delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Cristen Washington:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
examine. A Short Sharp Shock can be your answer as it can be read by an individual who have those short
time problems.

Elizabeth McNeal:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just telling
lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A Short Sharp Shock can be the response, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Michael Spicer:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book A Short Sharp Shock to make your
personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the sensation about book
and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a book and go through it.
Beside that the guide A Short Sharp Shock can to be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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