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"3-Minute Motivators" will show you how to turn unmotivated, unfocused groups or classes into eager
participants and learners. This practical handbook includes more than 100 simple ideas that will refocus a
group, release excess energy, or start a class with a bang. Organised around common challenges, "3-Minute
Motivators" offers a wide variety of ready-to-use activities that turn potential problems into opportunities,
and get students out of a rut and into a more productive mode including: Calm Down - relaxing activities that
let imaginations soar; Get Moving - lively motivators; Act, Don't Speak - silent but fun activities; Words and
Movement - activities that mix talk with action; Single Words & Sounds - simple communication activities;
Conversation - getting motivated one-on-one; Brainstorms - working together to let the ideas fly; and, Paper
& pencil activities - from letter and word play to shared stories. This book is an ideal resource for both new
and experienced teachers, teaching assistants and all those running groups, promoting inherently playful
activities that involve competition, cooperation and opportunities to focus on real learning.
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From reader reviews:

Laura Enriquez:

Often the book 3 Minute Motivators: More Than 120 Activities to Help You Reach, Teach and Achieve! has
a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was
authored by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research just before write this book.
This book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this article book.

Guadalupe Marshall:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, you
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like 3 Minute Motivators: More
Than 120 Activities to Help You Reach, Teach and Achieve! which is keeping the e-book version. So , why
not try out this book? Let's view.

Alexandra Robbins:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This 3 Minute Motivators: More Than
120 Activities to Help You Reach, Teach and Achieve! can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you
know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common
not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Sandra Bland:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news.
With this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the 3 Minute Motivators: More Than 120 Activities to Help You Reach, Teach and Achieve!
when you necessary it?
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