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Your light-hearted, practical approach to conquering calculus

Does the thought of calculus give you a coronary? You aren't alone. Thankfully, this new edition of Calculus
Workbook For Dummies makes it infinitely easier. Focusing "beyond the classroom," it contains calculus
exercises you can work on that will help to increase your confidence and improve your skills. This hands-on,
friendly guide gives you hundreds of practice problems on limits, vectors, continuity, differentiation,
integration, curve-sketching, conic sections, natural logarithms, and infinite series.

Calculus is a gateway and potential stumbling block for students interested in pursuing a career in math,
science, engineering, finance, and technology. Calculus students, along with math students in nearly all
disciplines, benefit greatly from opportunities to practice different types of problems—in the classroom and
out. Calculus Workbook For Dummies takes you step-by-step through each concept, operation, and solution,
explaining the "how" and "why" in plain English, rather than math-speak. Through relevant instruction and
practical examples, you'll soon learn that real-life calculus isn't nearly the monster it's made out to be.

Master differentiation and integration●

Use the calculus microscope: limits●

Analyze common functions●

Score your highest in calculus●

Complete with tips for problem-solving and traps to avoid, Calculus Workbook For Dummies is your sure-
fire weapon for conquering calculus!
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Lyons:

This Calculus Workbook For Dummies book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This
specific Calculus Workbook For Dummies without we comprehend teach the one who reading through it
become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't always be worry Calculus Workbook For Dummies
can bring whenever you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can
have it within your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Calculus Workbook For Dummies having great
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Tanisha Goss:

The book Calculus Workbook For Dummies will bring that you the new experience of reading a book. The
author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book you just read, this book very suited
to you. The book Calculus Workbook For Dummies is much recommended to you to see. You can also get
the e-book from your official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

John Sledge:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be
read. Calculus Workbook For Dummies can be your answer as it can be read by you who have those short
extra time problems.

Paul Quintana:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Calculus Workbook For Dummies
is simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not get
much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You
can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.
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