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Even beginner gardeners can select plants to create a stunning garden as unique as the mid-Atlantic
region - with expert help to ensure success!

Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide is a plant selection guide, perfect for when you're choosing
plants and starting a garden in a climate that can be as challenging as it is beautiful. Choose the right plants
and care for them properly with help from two of the area's most highly respected and experienced
plantsmen, Andre and Mark Viette, and horticulture writer Jacqui Heriteau.

The authors' top picks for plants that will thrive in (or in spite of) the regions's heat, humidity, winter cold,
soil, coastal climate, and other unique growing conditions guarantee success for the area gardeners and home
landscapers. Plants are divided into easy-to-browse chapters, including Annuals, Bulbs, Groundcovers,
Ornamental Grasses, Perennials, Shrubs, Trees, Lawns, and Vines. Each plant is highlighted in its respective
chapter with a large full-color photograph and tips on how, when, and where to plant.

Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide doesn't stop at plant selection. Methods for preparing soil,
watering, fertilizer application, and pest management are also covered in detail. Along with the "nitty-gritty"
of tending your garden, the authors share their inspiration for garden design, offer ways to incorporate your
plants into the landscape, and name some favorite cultivars or species. Their sound, practical advice is
clothed in beautiful descriptions of each plant that will inspire you to get your hands dirty!
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From reader reviews:

Ashley Paul:

Now a day folks who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot more to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden
Guide: Grow the Best Flowers, Shrubs, Trees, Vines & Groundcovers (Garden Guides) book since this book
offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there
is no doubt in it you may already know.

Johnnie Santiago:

The particular book Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide: Grow the Best Flowers, Shrubs, Trees,
Vines & Groundcovers (Garden Guides) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this
book you can get a lot of gain. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you may get the point easily after perusing this
book.

Elizabeth Sherer:

The book untitled Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide: Grow the Best Flowers, Shrubs, Trees, Vines
& Groundcovers (Garden Guides) contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains her idea with
easy method. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy
to read the item. The book was written by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of literary
works. It is possible to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or product, so you
can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official
web-site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Doris Whobrey:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide:
Grow the Best Flowers, Shrubs, Trees, Vines & Groundcovers (Garden Guides) to make your own personal
reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading expertise is developing when you similar to reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the impression about book and reading through
especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to start a book and examine it. Beside that the book
Mid-Atlantic Getting Started Garden Guide: Grow the Best Flowers, Shrubs, Trees, Vines & Groundcovers
(Garden Guides) can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of this time.
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