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In the 1980s, public sector unionism has become the most vibrant component of the American labor
movement. What does this new "look" of organized labor mean for the economy? Do labor-management
relations in the public sector mirror patterns in the private, or do they introduce a novel paradigm onto the
labor scene? What can the private sector learn from the success of collective bargaining in the public?

Contributors to When Public Sector Workers Unionize—which was developed from the NBER's program on
labor studies—examine these and other questions using newly collected data on public sector labor laws,
labor relations practices of state and local governments, and labor market outcomes. Topics considered
include the role, effect, and evolution of public sector labor law and the effects that public sector bargaining
has on both wage and nonwage issues.

Several themes emerge from the studies in this volume. Most important, public sector labor law has a strong
and pervasive effect on bargaining and on wage and employment outcomes in public sector labor markets.
Also, public sector unionism affects the economy in ways that are different from, and in many cases opposite
to, the ways private sector unionism does, appearing to stimulate rather than reduce employment, reducing
rather than increasing layoff rates, and developing innovate ways to settle labor disputes such as compulsory
interest arbitration instead of strikes and lockouts found in the private sector.
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From reader reviews:

Lucile Brown:

The particular book When Public Sector Workers Unionize (National Bureau of Economic Research Project
Report) will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to
clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book you just read, this book very suited to you.
The book When Public Sector Workers Unionize (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) is
much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can
more easily to read the book.

Toni Williams:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader
with their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this
When Public Sector Workers Unionize (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report).

Susan Scott:

This When Public Sector Workers Unionize (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) is great
reserve for you because the content which is full of information for you who always deal with world and also
have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we
can claim no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't
mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having When Public Sector Workers Unionize (National Bureau of Economic Research Project
Report) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say
that no reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen moment right but this publication already do that. So
, this is certainly good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?

Rachel Haley:

You can spend your free time to see this book this publication. This When Public Sector Workers Unionize
(National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) is simple to bring you can read it in the playground,
in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy
the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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