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A Puffin Book - stories that last a lifetime. Puffin Modern Classics are relaunched under a new logo: A
Puffin Book. There are 20 titles to collect in the series, listed below, all with exciting new covers and fun-
filled endnotes. Clive King's Stig of the Dump is a much-loved modern classic. It is the story of Barney and
his best friend, cave-man Stig. Barney is a solitary little boy, given to wandering off by himself. One day he
is lying on the edge of a disused chalk-pit when it gives way and he lands in a sort of cave. Here he meets
'somebody with a lot of shaggy hair and two bright black eyes' wearing a rabbit skin and speaking in grunts.
He names him Stig. Of course nobody believes Barney when he tells his family all about Stig, but for Barney
cave-man Stig is totally real. They become great friends, learning each others ways and embarking on a
series of unforgettable adventures. Clive King was born in Richmond, Surrey, in 1924. When he was young
his family moved to a village called Ash, near Sevenoaks in Kent, which is the setting for Stig of the Dump.
He went to Downing College, Cambridge, and the School of Oriental and African Studies in London. He
then served in the Royal Naval Volunteer Reserve. His service as a sailor and his work as a language teacher
took him all over the world. Clive King lives with his family in Norfolk and is a full-time writer. Also
available in A Puffin Book: GOODNIGHT MISTER TOM and BACK HOME by Michelle Magorian
CHARLOTTE'S WEB, STUART LITTLE and THE TRUMPET OF THE SWAN by E. B. White THE
BORROWERS by Mary Norton STIG OF THE DUMP by Clive King ROLL OF THUNDER, HEAR MY
CRY by Mildred D. Taylor A DOG SO SMALL by Philippa Pearce GOBBOLINO by Ursula Moray
Williams CARRIE'S WAR by Nina Bawden MRS FRISBY AND THE RATS OF NIMH by Richard C
O'Brien A WRINKLE IN TIME by Madeleine L'Engle THE CAY by Theodore Taylor TARKA THE
OTTER by Henry Williamson WATERSHIP DOWN by Richard Adams SMITH by Leon Garfield THE
NEVERENDING STORY by Michael Ende ANNIE by Thomas Meehan THE FAMILY FROM ONE END
STREET by Eve Garnett Other titles by Clive King: Hamid of Aleppo; The Town that Went South; The 22
Letters; The Night the Water Came; Snakes and Snakes; Me and My Million; The Inner Ring series; The
Devil's Cut; Ninny's Boat; The Sound of propellors; The Seashore People; A Touch of Class
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From reader reviews:

Hilda Baker:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. These
are reading whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Stig of the Dump (A Puffin Book).

Oliver Lyle:

Within other case, little people like to read book Stig of the Dump (A Puffin Book). You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about how is important the book Stig of the
Dump (A Puffin Book). You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can understand everything! From your country until foreign
or abroad you will end up known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era,
we can open a book or searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel
bored stiff to go to the library. Let's examine.

Fred Simpson:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Stig of the Dump (A Puffin
Book). All type of book would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

Lewis Shafer:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The Stig of the
Dump (A Puffin Book) offer you a new experience in reading a book.
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