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Voyageur Press is proud to publish this new edition of Eric Sloane’s classic folksy history of American
weather. Combining two Sloane books, "Eric Sloane’s Almanac and Weather Forecaster" (1955) and
"Folklore of American Weather" (1963), this omnibus is filled with traditional weather sayings and beliefs.
In "Eric Sloane’s Weather Almanac," readers will learn forecasting tips such as which winds bring what
kinds of weather, how to ""read"" clouds, how to foretell the weather by the moon, and more. Also included
is fun climate lore such as old-time sayings about when sap is running and why you should dig your well
where lightning has struck. One hundred thirty-five of Sloane’s drawings clarify and enhance the text of this
entertaining and informative book by one of the most popular recorders of American history. Before Eric
Sloane (1905-1985) became famous for paintings and books, he was one of the top weather experts in the
United States and wrote several books on the subject for the U.S. Navy.
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From reader reviews:

Amanda Chatham:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac. Try to the actual book Eric
Sloane's Weather Almanac as your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you experience
alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself.
The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we
should make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Martin McDaniel:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important usually. The book Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac seemed to be making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you.
The e-book Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac is not only giving you more new information but also to become
your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book.
Try to make relationship using the book Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac. You never experience lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Freddy Lamberth:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title Eric Sloane's
Weather Almanac suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. The
actual book untitled Eric Sloane's Weather Almanacis the main one of several books this everyone read now.
This specific book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the
new dimensions that you ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, so all of
people can easily to recognise the core of this guide. This book will give you a lots of information about this
world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Tammy Mangold:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac was
vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Eric Sloane's Weather Almanac has
many kinds or style. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and
think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it
makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading this.
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