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Little Book of Beliefs is an express tour of belief topics for curious minds. Is there a God? What is the
purpose of life? Do humans have souls? Why do bad things happen to good people and vice versa? Life is a
mystery and we're still guessing about its meaning and purpose.

Our personal beliefs, whether vague or specific, philosophical or spiritual, surely influence our values and
outlook on life. Philip Koehn, author of Choosing your Religion and Exploring the Major Faiths, presents a
brief synopsis of key philosophical and spiritual topics in this compact analysis.

Questions about existence? What does it mean to be a human being? Does reality exist only in the mind of
the beholder or is reality independent of human perception? Do humans create the human condition or does a
higher being impose it? Little Book of Beliefs explores some of the possible answers to these and other
existential questions. It raises many of the questions that are likely to remain unsettled and answered only by
beliefs.

Little Book of Beliefs is divided into three sections: Philosophy, Religion, and Spiritual Metaphysics. The
book roams far and wide to look at this mystery from different angles. It looks at the big philosophical
questions, important points of faith, and esoteric beliefs, the subjects that often define one's belief
orientation. It examines topics as diverse as auras, God, ethics, existentialism, the human condition, karma,
moral values, mysticism, nature spirits, and salvation, pieces of a puzzle we may never fit together. It is a
"believe it or not" book about beliefs themselves.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Nguyen:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book
entitled Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion & Spiritual Metaphysics too? Maybe it is to
become best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Michelle Fulk:

Here thing why this particular Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion & Spiritual Metaphysics
too are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it really depends in the
content of it which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to
Religion & Spiritual Metaphysics too giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
guide out there but there is no reserve that similar with Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion
& Spiritual Metaphysics too. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes about
the thing which happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion &
Spiritual Metaphysics too in e-book can be your alternate.

Molly Wilson:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion &
Spiritual Metaphysics too as the daily resource information.

Ettie Hardcastle:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is referred to
as of book Little Book of Beliefs: From Philosophy to Religion & Spiritual Metaphysics too. You can
include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and
make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one
spot to other place.
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