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FUNDAMENTALS OF LOGIC DESIGN provides a thorough presentation of fundamental concepts for a
first course in the logic design of digital systems for both engineering and computer science students. The
book covers in depth such essential concepts as the use of Boolean algebra to describe the signals and
interconnections in a logic network, use of systematic techniques for simplification of a logic network,
interconnection of simple components to perform a more complex logic function, analysis of a sequential
logic network in terms of timing charts or a state graph, and use of a control network to control the sequence
of events in a digital system. It offers a balance of theory and practical applications that prepares readers for
more advanced studies in digital systems design and switching theory. Ideal for use in a self-paced course,
FUNDAMENTALS OF LOGIC DESIGN provides self-study aids such as reading assignments and study
questions within each of its 27 study units. A computer-aided logic design program, LogicAidO, is suggested
for use with this text."
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From reader reviews:

Kathryn Robinson:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Fundamentals of Logic Design.
All type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Lorenza Jones:

This book untitled Fundamentals of Logic Design to be one of several books that will best seller in this year,
that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there
is no reason to you personally to past this reserve from your list.

Myron Mendez:

This Fundamentals of Logic Design is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some
information given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you
know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this Fundamentals of Logic Design can be the light
food in your case because the information inside this specific book is easy to get through anyone. These
books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book form. People
who think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is not
any in reading a book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for
anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book kind for your better life as well as knowledge.

Nicole Powell:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of
book Fundamentals of Logic Design. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing the
printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most essential that, you
must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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